

RFO 2022-113, Adobe Licenses

ePlus Technology, Inc. and Software Information Resource Corp.
were deemed non-responsive for failure to provide a cooperative contract
number on their quotations as required.
No bid: PROVANTAGE® LLC

ePlus Technology, Inc. and Software Information Resource Corp. were deemed non-responsive for failure to provide a cooperative contract number on their quotations as required. No bid: PROVANTAGE® LLC				Emergent, LLC Virginia Beach, VA HUB - No		Summus Industries, Inc. Sugar Land, TX HUB - Yes	
Item No.	Description	Adobe #	Quantity	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price
Section 1							
Base Year (5/28/2022-5/27/2023)							
1	VLA ETLA ADOBE ACROBAT PRO ENTERPRISE TERM LICENSE PER USER 1YR	65286686	1600	\$70.10	\$112,160.00	\$71.58	\$114,528.00
2	VLA ETLA ADOBE CREATIVE CLOUD ENT TERM LIC SINGLE APPS - PER USER - 1YR	65300291	45	\$402.06	\$18,092.70	\$410.53	\$18,473.85
3	VLA ETLA ADOBE CREATIVE CLOUD ENT ALL APPS -TERM LIC & MAINT & SUP FLP	65274430	65	\$824.74	\$53,608.10	\$842.11	\$54,737.15
	Base Year Total			\$183,860.80		\$187,739.00	
Option Year One (5/28/2023-5/27/2024)							
1	VLA ETLA ADOBE ACROBAT PRO ENTERPRISE TERM LICENSE PER USER 1YR	65286686	1600	\$74.23	\$118,768.00	\$75.79	\$121,264.00
2	VLA ETLA ADOBE CREATIVE CLOUD ENT TERM LIC SINGLE APPS - PER USER - 1YR	65300291	45	\$402.06	\$18,092.70	\$410.53	\$18,473.85
3	VLA ETLA ADOBE CREATIVE CLOUD ENT ALL APPS -TERM LIC & MAINT & SUP FLP	65274430	65	\$824.74	\$53,608.10	\$842.11	\$54,737.15
	Option Year One Total			\$190,468.80		\$194,475.00	

RFO 2022-113, Adobe Licenses

ePlus Technology, Inc. and Software Information Resource Corp.
were deemed non-responsive for failure to provide a cooperative contract
number on their quotations as required.
No bid: PROVANTAGE® LLC

ePlus Technology, Inc. and Software Information Resource Corp. were deemed non-responsive for failure to provide a cooperative contract number on their quotations as required. No bid: PROVANTAGE® LLC				Emergent, LLC Virginia Beach, VA HUB - No		Summus Industries, Inc. Sugar Land, TX HUB - Yes	
Item No.	Description	Adobe #	Quantity	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price
Option Year Two (5/28/2024-5/27/2025)							
1	VLA ETLA ADOBE ACROBAT PRO ENTERPRISE TERM LICENSE PER USER 1YR	65286686	1600	\$77.30	\$123,680.00	\$78.95	\$126,320.00
2	VLA ETLA ADOBE CREATIVE CLOUD ENT TERM LIC SINGLE APPS - PER USER - 1YR	65300291	45	\$402.06	\$18,092.70	\$410.53	\$18,473.85
3	VLA ETLA ADOBE CREATIVE CLOUD ENT ALL APPS -TERM LIC & MAINT & SUP FLP	65274430	65	\$824.74	\$53,608.10	\$842.11	\$54,737.15
	Option Year TwoTotal			\$195,380.80		\$199,531.00	
True-Up							
1	VLA ETLA ADOBE ACROBAT PRO ENTERPRISE TERM LICENSE PER USER 1YR	65286686	1	\$77.30	\$77.30	\$78.95	\$78.95
2	VLA ETLA ADOBE CREATIVE CLOUD ENT TERM LIC SINGLE APPS - PER USER - 1YR	65300291	1	\$402.06	\$402.06	\$410.53	\$410.53
3	VLA ETLA ADOBE CREATIVE CLOUD ENT ALL APPS -TERM LIC & MAINT & SUP FLP	65274430	1	\$824.74	\$824.74	\$842.11	\$842.11
	True-Up Total			\$1,304.10		\$1,331.59	
Section 1 Grand Total				\$571,014.50		\$583,076.59	
BASE YEAR TOTAL (5/28/2022-5/27/2023) + TRUE-UP				\$185,164.90		\$189,070.59	

Section 1 Award Recommendation:
Emergent, LLC

RFO 2022-113, Adobe Licenses

ePlus Technology, Inc. and Software Information Resource Corp.
were deemed non-responsive for failure to provide a cooperative contract
number on their quotations as required.
No bid: PROVANTAGE® LLC

ePlus Technology, Inc. and Software Information Resource Corp. were deemed non-responsive for failure to provide a cooperative contract number on their quotations as required. No bid: PROVANTAGE® LLC				Emergent, LLC Virginia Beach, VA HUB - No		Summus Industries, Inc. Sugar Land, TX HUB - Yes	
Item No.	Description	Adobe #	Quantity	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price
Section 2							
Base Year (5/28/2022-5/27/2023)							
1	VLA ADOBE SIGN FOR ENTERPRISE SUBS - EACH SUBS 12 MONTHS 50K SUBS PACK	65315743	1	\$56,701.00	\$56,701.00	\$57,894.74	\$57,894.74
	Base Year Total			\$56,701.00		\$57,894.74	
Option Year One (5/28/2023-5/27/2024)							
1	VLA ADOBE SIGN FOR ENTERPRISE SUBS - EACH SUBS 12 MONTHS 50K SUBS PACK	65315743	1	\$56,701.00	\$56,701.00	\$57,894.74	\$57,894.74
	Option Year One Total			\$56,701.00		\$57,894.74	
Option Year Two (5/28/2024-5/27/2025)							
1	VLA ADOBE SIGN FOR ENTERPRISE SUBS - EACH SUBS 12 MONTHS 50K SUBS PACK	65315743	1	\$56,701.00	\$56,701.00	\$57,894.74	\$57,894.74
	Option Year TwoTotal			\$56,701.00		\$57,894.74	
Section 2 Grand Total				\$170,103.00		\$173,684.22	

Section 2 Award Recommendation:
Emergent, LLC